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the number of start-ups, the number of nascent 
entrepreneurs, and the ratio of opportunity-driven to 
necessity-driven entrepreneurs. 

The Union of Chambers and Commodity 
Exchanges of Turkey (TOBB) is more than willing 
to play its part in this important process. TOBB 
has already established two very active groups of 
entrepreneurs: TOBB Women Entrepreneurs Board 
in 2007 and TOBB Young Entrepreneurs Board in 
2009. 

Moreover, Turkish Venture Capital Assembly, 
established this year, works to improve the climate 
for early stage investments and strengthen the 
networks of business angels and venture capitalists, 
which are essential factors of the entrepreneurship 
ecosystem. 

In addition to these dynamic groups, TOBB 
launched the Turkey chapter for the Partners for a 
New Beginning Program (PNB) with Aspen Institute 
and the U.S. State Department, which aims to build 
public-private partnerships to advance economic 
opportunity, science & technology and education. 

TOBB University of Economics and Technology 
contributes to the education side of this combined 
effort of TOBB. The newly established Department 

Turkey has come a long way in terms of 

economic and private sector development since 

1980s, and now classified as one of the efficiency-

driven economies in the world, in a group that 

includes high-growth economies such as Brazil 

and China. Firms in an efficiency-driven economy 

compete and grow by cutting down costs, while 

firms in an innovation-driven economy compete and 

grow by creating unique value at the global level. 

In order to upgrade to an innovation-driven stage, 

Turkish economy needs high-impact enterprises that 

are able to scale-up to the global level by creating 

unique value. Entrepreneurship is a key factor in 

creating high-impact enterprises.

This report successfully identifies the key 

areas Turkey needs to work on in order to improve 

entrepreneurship. Although Turkey aims for a 

transition from being an efficiency-driven economy 

to being an innovation-driven economy, in many 

areas Turkey is still behind its efficiency-driven 

counterparts. Access to finance, lack of business 

opportunities, the tax and administration burden, 

inadequate entrepreneurship education and the 

lack of cultural support are still the main obstacles 

for developing entrepreneurship in Turkey. Turkey 

is behind the other efficiency-driven countries in 

Foreword
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I hope this report to be a useful contribution to 

the current efforts in Turkey that aim to increase the 

level of entrepreneurship in this country. May this 

report benefit everyone, who seeks to learn about 

entrepreneurship in Turkey, and provide a clear 

picture of how Turkey can complete its jump to 

become an innovation-driven economy. 

M. Rifat HİSARCIKLIOĞLU

TOBB President

of International Entrepreneurship of the TOBB 
Economics and Technology University admitted 
its first students in the school year 2010-2011. This 
department aims to raise entrepreneurs that study 
economics and at the same time Russian and Arabic 
and that are capable of doing business both in Turkey 
and in the countries of the region. 

Another TOBB program, Allworld Turkey 25, 
which identifies and celebrates the fastest growing 
entrepreneurs of Turkey, is about to be completed. 
The results will be announced at the Presidential 
Summit on Entrepreneurship this December. 
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internationally accepted and implemented measure 

of entrepreneurship data that can provide reliable 

comparisons among the countries that do take part. 

The level of early stage entrepreneurship activity 

in 2010 in Turkey was 8.6% which means that 

about 9 out of every 100 adults were entrepreneurs 

according to the “GEM definition”. When compared 

with 2008, year 2010 showed a more positive outlook 

for entrepreneurship in Turkey. In 2008, among our 

respondents, 6% were identified as being involved 

in entrepreneurial activity; thus, six out of every 100 

adults in Turkey were entrepreneurs. The number of 

individuals who are actively looking for and taking 

advantage of business opportunities has increased 

since 2008 in Turkey. This shows that Turkey had 

the higher proportion of entrepreneurs in 2010 

when compared to 2008 among “similar” phases of 

economic development included in the GEM study. 

During 2010, 3.69% of the adult population 

in Turkey was actively trying to start a business 

(nascent entrepreneurs). Turkey experienced slightly 

higher start up entrepreneurial activity over the year 

2008 (3.19%). The increased proportion of nascent 

entrepreneurs can be considered an indicator for 

new business activity in the future, especially when 

global economic circumstances improve. When we 

Entrepreneurship is a vital part of national 

economic growth and development. The Global 

Entrepreneurship Monitor (GEM) is a major 

international research study aimed at increasing our 

knowledge of entrepreneurship. This report reviews 

the main findings of the 2010 GEM survey and 

suggests key measures to stimulate entrepreneurial 

activity in Turkey. 

Since 2008 the countries that participate in 

the GEM project have been classified according to 

Porter’s typology of “factor-driven economies”, 

“efficiency-driven economies” and “innovation-

driven economies” (GEM, 2008). Turkey is 

currently at the efficiency-driven stage of economic 

development. The other countries included in 

this group are as follows: Argentina, Bosnia and 

Herzegovina, Brazil, Chile, China, Colombia, Costa 

Rica, Croatia, Ecuador, Hungary, Latvia, Macedonia, 

Malaysia, Mexico, Montenegro, Peru, Romania, 

Russia, South Africa, Taiwan, Trinidad and Tobago, 

Tunisia, and Uruguay. 

The main measure of entrepreneurial activity 

published by GEM is the Total Entrepreneurial 

Activity (TEA) index. The TEA measures the 

proportion of a country’s adults who are involved in 

starting or running new businesses. TEA is the only 

Executive Summary
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compare start-up rates in Turkey (3.69%) with those 

in other efficiency-driven economies (6.7%), Turkey 

has lower than average start up rates.

On the other hand, in 2010 5.05% of the 

adult population in Turkey was owner-managers 

of a business that was 3-42 months old (new 

businesses). This was an increase over the figure 

for 2008 (3.01%). The increase in the prevalence of 

new business appears to reflect an improvement in 

overall economic growth. 

The ratio of new firms to start-ups has increased 

from 0.94 in 2008 to 1.36 in 2010, suggesting that 

in Turkey many businesses progress beyond the 

start-up phase. The survival and growth of new 

business should have a positive effect on economic 

development. 

On the other hand, the rate for already established 

businesses to endure more than 42 months was 

10.73% in 2010, a remarkable expansion over the 

same index for 2008, which was only 4.82%. This 

indicates that between 2008 and 2010, 5.91% more 

of early stage entrepreneurs were transformed into 

established businesses. This appears to indicate 

increasing stability or sustainability of business 

activities in Turkey, which is very important for 

creating and maintaining employment and general 

economic well being. 

In Turkey, 4.64% of entrepreneurs exited from 

their businesses in 2010. Entrepreneurial activity 

must be assessed not only by the number of new 

actors entering the market of competition, but also 

by the number of those exiting it. The nascent 

entrepreneurs involved in creating new businesses 

are 3.7% fewer than those that exit. The number of 

entrepreneurs who exited the market exceeding the 

number of entrepreneurs who entered the market in 

2010 must be interpreted to reflect that expansion of 

entrepreneurship is not significant in Turkey. 

According to the GEM report, the main reason 

for those exiting their businesses in 2010 was the 

“problem [of] getting finance [sic]”. Most likely, 
difficulties in attracting additional financing for 
established businesses after the recession as well as 
problems securing start-up financing was important 
for the viability of business in 2010. 

The number of entrepreneurs pursuing a business 
opportunity in Turkey increased in 2010; however, 
that number is relatively low proportionally compared 
with the other efficiency-driven economies. On the 
other hand, the number of “necessity-entrepreneurs” 
in Turkey proportionally is relatively high on a 
global scale, implying that relatively more Turkish 
entrepreneurs have taken the entrepreneurial route 
out of necessity. Hence, Turkey has a less favorable 
ratio of opportunity- to necessity-driven early stage 
entrepreneurs compared with 2008. People in Turkey 
are pushed into entrepreneurship because they have 
no other means of making a living or because they 
fear becoming unemployed in the near future. The 
discrepancy between male and female is even higher 
for opportunity entrepreneurship. 

For 2010, the proportions of university degree- 
and post-graduate degree- entrepreneurs have 
increased compared with those of 2008. Evidence 
from the GEM research from Turkey suggests that 
people who have attained higher levels of education 
tend to be opportunity-driven entrepreneurs. 
Conversely, people who have gone less far with 
their education start their own businesses because 
they have less choice among options for suitable 
employment (necessity-driven entrepreneurs). 
Opportunity entrepreneurs are non-existent among 
the illiterate population. On the other hand, necessity 
entrepreneurial activity is non-existent for people 
who have a high level of education (university and 
graduate experience). 

In general terms, and to summarize, our results 
also indicate that people of low-to-middle income 
who embark on or have embarked on a business tend 
to be necessity-driven entrepreneurs. Conversely, 
at the highest income level, persons tend to be 
opportunity-driven entrepreneurs.
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With respect to gender, the GEM data show 

that, worldwide, more men than women become 

entrepreneurs. Consistent with this pattern in other 

countries, almost 70 % of all entrepreneurs in 

Turkey are men. The good news is that the ratio of 

male to female entrepreneurs has decreased slightly 

from 2008 to 2010. Nevertheless, indicative of a 

continuing dearth of opportunities for women, the 

ratio in Turkey of male to female is the highest, 

or most inequitable, among the efficiency-driven 

economies. The male TEA rates are 3.63 times 

higher than the female TEA rates. 

The GEM data also show that gender attitudes 

are different towards entrepreneurship. A higher 

percentage of men than women see more favorable 

opportunities in the environment for starting a 

business. Men are also more confident that they 

possess the knowledge and experience necessary 

for starting a new business and they have less fear 

of failure. Men have more networking resources 

and know, for example, more people who started 

a business than do women. More efforts should be 

made to encourage women to participate in business 

as entrepreneurs. 

Consistent with international findings, Turkish 

people in the highest household income brackets are 

more likely to start a new company. 76 % of Turkish 

entrepreneurs are found in the highest 33% income 

level, and only 8% of Turkish entrepreneurs come 

from the lowest 33% income level. Clearly, starting a 

company if your household income is low is difficult. 

Special attention should be paid to these people.

The GEM study shows that 66% of 

entrepreneurial activity in Turkey took place in the 

consumer oriented sector. There was a significant 

increase in the consumer oriented sector from 2008 to 

2010 and a decrease in other sectors, especially in the 

share of entrepreneurs involved in the transforming 

industries (manufacturing and construction), which 

dropped from 34% to 20%. In 2010, the most start-

ups focused on end users of the goods and services 

industries, which do not require as much startup 

capital.

In the GEM study, 36.14% of Turkish respondents 

considered that there were good opportunities 

for start-ups, which is lower than the average for 

efficiency-driven countries of 42.94%. Nevertheless, 

the Turkish experts are generally optimistic about 

the existence of opportunities in Turkey. Most of the 

business professionals mentioned that they believe 

there will be plentiful opportunities for starting new 

business in next six months.

More than half of those polled (54%) believed 

that they had the skills necessary to start a new 

business. This level of self belief among respondents 

in Turkey represents an increase from 2008, when 

the figure was 49%. Accordingly, Turks appear to 

be more confident and positive with regard to the 

skills they believe they possess in order to start up a 

new business. On the other hand, the opinion of our 

professionals about the population’s entrepreneurial 

abilities was negative with regard to the ability to 

start and manage a high-growth business, and to 

organize the resources required for a new business; 

furthermore, they did not believe Turks, in general, 

possessed the experience necessary to start a new 

business.

With regard to networks of relationships with 

others, 36.43% of Turkish business persons polled in 

the GEM study knew someone personally who had 

started a business in the past two years, a lower figure 

compared to the average score for the efficiency 

driven countries (45.34%). 

In 2010, 33% of Turkish respondents mentioned 

that fear of failure prevented them from embarking 

on a new business. Turkey is 8th lowest with regard 

to the level of fear of failure among the efficiency 

driven countries. This figure is slightly lower than 

the average for efficiency-driven countries, or 35%. 

At the same time, the share of those in Turkey 

delayed by fear of failure in starting a new business 
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decreased by about 3 percent by comparison with 

2008. Because of high unemployment, one can 

conclude that this decline was due to the lack of 

other opportunities in the labor market. 

In terms of society-related measures to 

entrepreneurship, 75.44 % of Turkish adult 

population felt that starting a business is a good 

career choice, the result is higher than the average of 

efficiency-driven countries. 

Consistent with findings from previous years 

about the perceptual measures of entrepreneurship, 

Turkey is still relatively weaker than other countries. 

However, in terms of social-related measures to 

entrepreneurship, our figures show improvement.

The GEM research model identifies nine 

entrepreneurial framework conditions that are 

considered to have an impact on entrepreneurial 

activity within a country. The nine entrepreneurial 

framework conditions are: financial support, 

government policies, government programs, 

education and training, research and development 

transfer, commercial and professional infrastructure, 

market openness, access to physical infrastructure, 

and entrepreneurial culture and attitude toward 

entrepreneurship. 

Among these entrepreneurial framework 

conditions, the experts gave their most positive 

assessment to attitude toward entrepreneurship, 

market openness to speed of change in the market, and 

ease of access to physical infrastructure. Supporting 

the findings on the increase in entrepreneurial activity 

levels in Turkey in 2010, the 36 experts polled rated 

Turkey’s environment for entrepreneurship generally 

to be more favorable than in 2008.

Government policy in support of business 

endeavor in Turkey, at all levels of government 

(national, regional, municipal) has grown. For 

example, with regard to government regulation, 

the experts believe that the tax and administration 

burden may have improved slightly over the last two 

years; however, this is still a key area of complaint 

among the experts. 

Technology transfer refers to the transfer of 

new technology and scientific and other knowledge 

from universities and research institutions to new or 

expanding businesses; for 2010, the experts were 

more positive than they were in 2008; research 

and development (R&D) Indicators confirm such 

progress. The ratio of R&D spending to Gross 

National Product (GNP), the private sector’s share in 

R&D funding, and the number of full-time equivalent 

R&D personnel have all increased since 2008. 

Turkish experts give a better rating in 2010 than 

in previous years to general preparation in primary 

and secondary education for young people who 

might be interested in careers in business. Those 

polled believe that schools are encouraging more 

creativity, self-sufficiency, and personal initiative, 

and are providing more information about principles 

of market economics and more attention, specifically, 

to entrepreneurship skills. 

In contrast to these positive trends in primary 

and secondary education about training for 

entrepreneurship, the Turkish experts negatively 

assess both the quality and quantity of university 

and vocational education, expressing the belief that 

higher educational institutions are not providing 

adequate preparation for starting up a new business 

nor for growing an existing business.

 According to the experts, there are more 

opportunities for entrepreneurship in Turkey 

than there are people equipped with the skills 

necessary to take advantage of them. Therefore, 

opportunity recognition and opportunity shaping 

should be put high on the agenda, and education for 

entrepreneurship should be further developed. 

Importantly, availability of funding in Turkey 

has been changing for the better over the years. 

According to the experts, the greatest increase is 

seen in the availabilty of debt and equity funding. 
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However, there are mixed views about government 
subsidies even as some increases are seen with 
regard to the availability of business angels, and of 
venture capital and capital raised from initial public 
offerings. The general opinion is that, although the 
availability of resources are increasing it remains the 
case that insufficient financial support is undermining 
entrepreneurship in Turkey.

A long-term barrier appears to derive from 
cultural norms surrounding entrepreneurship. 
The national culture does not emphasize self-
sufficiency, autonomy or personal initiative and does 
not encourage creativity and innovation in young 
people. Traditional emphasis in Turkish society on 

obedience, reinforced by the practice of educating 

children as much within the family unit as in formal 

education, subverts the development of creativity, 

innovation, and personal initiative. 

An important point to consider, while by no 

means the only factor, entrepreneurship gives us 

the means to overcome the challenges of the current 

economic crisis. This is because an increase in 

the number of skilled entrepreneursin a society 

historically has been shown to help end recessions 

by reallocating resources from obsolete economic 

activities to new and more dynamic ones (GEM 

2008).
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Introduction

• 	 Are the differences in national 

entrepreneurial activity related to national 

economic growth?

• 	 What national characteristics are related 

to differences in types of entrepreneurial 

activity?

Entrepreneurship and Stages of 
Economic Development

GEM analyzes the contribution of 

entrepreneurship to an economy according to its 

stages of development. The countries in this report are 

grouped into three stages of economic development, 

as defined by the World Economic Forum’s Global 

Competitiveness Report: factor-driven, efficiency-

driven, and innovation-driven (Figure 1). 

Factor-driven countries primarily compete with 

regard to low prices and natural resources. Enterprises 

are mainly involved in primary production. An 

economy is particularly vulnerable to fluctuations 

in the world economic cycle, commodity prices, and 

exchange rates. 

Global Entrepreneurship Monitor 
(GEM)

The Global Entrepreneurship Monitor (GEM) is 

a unique, global initiative that explores relationships 

between entrepreneurship and economic growth. 

It produces unique, globally comparable data on 

the entrepreneurial potential of nations, thereby 

providing an annually updated data and reference 

material for economic policy makers interested in 

entrepreneurship.

GEM was initiated in 1997 by leading scholars 

from Babson College (US) and the London Business 

School (UK). In 1999, when the first annual GEM 

report was published, 10 countries participated in 

the initiative. In 2010, altogether 59 countries are 

involved from all continents around the World. 

GEM set out to explore three fundamental 

questions:

• 	 Does the type of entrepreneurial activity 

vary between countries?
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Efficiency-driven countries produce standard 

products and services. Productivity is improved 

through increased investment in infrastructure and 

a business-friendly environment. Enterprises move 

up the value chain beyond basic manufacturing 

toward product design, distribution, and marketing. 

Financial crises and external, sector-specific demand 

shocks can still impact the economy. 

Innovation-driven economies are characterized 

by their production of new and unique products and/

or services for the global market, driving advances in 

technology and business methods. Service industries 

play an increasingly important role and contribute 

significantly to GDP. Economies at this stage of 

development are more resilient in a volatile global 

economy. 

As countries develop economically, they 

tend to shift from one phase to the next. Turkey is 

currently at the efficiency-driven stage of economic 

development (Figure 2).

GEM Definition of 
Entrepreneurship

The Global Entrepreneurship Monitor (GEM) 

research program defines active entrepreneurs 

as “adults in the process of setting up a business 

Figure 1 - Characteristics of Economic Groups and Key Development Focus

Source: GEM Global Report 2010

Figure 2 - Countries Participated in GEM Project in 2010

esra
Yapışkan Not
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who will (partly) own and/or are currently owning 

and managing an operating young business” and 

defines entrepreneurship as “any attempt to create 

a new business enterprise or to expand an existing 

business by an individual, a team of individuals, or 

an established business” (Reynolds et al., 2005). 

Entrepreneurs in GEM are classified according to 

the age of their establishments and their motivations. 

Based on the age of enterprises, GEM classifies 

potential entrepreneurs, nascent entrepreneurs, new 

business owners, early stage entrepreneurs, and 

established business owners. Figure 3 summarizes 

the entrepreneurial process and GEM’s operational 

definitions.

Potential entrepreneurs are either working 

to start a business at the moment or are thinking of 

establishing a business in the future.

Nascent entrepreneurs are currently active 

in trying to start a business, have not yet paid any 

salaries or wages, or have paid less than three months 

wages among the adult population aged 18-64 years.

New firm entrepreneurs are currently active in 

running a business that has paid salaries or wages for 

more than three months but less that 3.5 years among 

the adult population aged 18-64 years.

Total early stage entrepreneurs (TEA), as 
the name implies, combines nascent entrepreneurs 
with new business entrepreneurs among the adult 
population aged 18-64 years. In some instances, this 
rate is less than the combined percentages for nascent 
entrepreneurs and new firm entrepreneurs. This is 
because, in circumstances where respondents qualify 
as both a nascent and a new firm entrepreneur, they 
are counted only once.

Established business owners (EB) are 
individuals among the adult population aged 18-
64 years who have set up businesses that they have 
continued to own and manage and that have paid 
wages or salaries for more than 42 months.

 

Figure 3 -  The Entrepreneurship Process and GEM Operational Definitions

Source: GEM Global Report 2010
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GEM employs three research 
approaches:

1. Adult Population Surveys
2000 or more adults were selected in each 

country for a random sampling survey using a 

common survey instrument via telephone. The 

survey is used to estimate the entrepreneurial 

participation in the country concerned as well as to 

capture various attitudes of the population towards 

entrepreneurship. The results of the analysis are 

drawn from the responses of the working age group 

(18 to 64 years old). 

2. Country Experts Interviews
The GEM national research team in participating 

countries collected two types of data from country 

experts. In depth interviews were conducted using 

both structured questionnaire (standard questionnaire 

for all countries) as well as open-ended discussions. 

The structured questionnaire data were used to 

provide Likert-Scale indices on the status of each of 
the nine framework conditions that are comparable 
across the participating countries. The open-ended 
discussions were transcribed for qualitative content 
analysis. 

In Turkey, 36 key informants including 
entrepreneurs and venture support professionals 
were interviewed by the GEM national research team 
to gather data representing the nine entrepreneurial 
framework conditions: presence of financial support, 
government policies, government programs, 
education and training, research and development 
transfer, commercial and professional infrastructure, 
internal market openness, access to physical 
infrastructure, and cultural and social norms related 

to entrepreneurship. 

3. Collection of Secondary 
National Socio-Economic Data

In addition to the primary data collection, 

selected national socio-economic data from various 

national and international sources, including the 

Organization for Economic Cooperation and 

Development (OECD), 

GEM Research Methodology & 
Data Sources
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Entrepreneurial Activity in Turkey

2) 	 owner-managers of new firms, i.e., individuals 

who currently own a business that is less than 42 

months old (new business).

The TEA index is calculated as the number of 

entrepreneurially active individuals who belong to 

one of the two categories mentioned above and who 

are in the age range of 18-64 years. We first analyze 

the TEA results, and then focus on the prevalence 

rate for start-ups and new firms. 

One of the main objectives of the GEM research 
project is to assess the level of entrepreneurial 
activity in a harmonized way that allows for reliable 
cross-country comparisons. In order to accomplish 
this, a Total Entrepreneurial Activity (TEA) index 
is calculated for each country. The TEA index is 
the combination of the following two types of 
entrepreneurs:

1) 	 Nascent entrepreneurs, i.e., individuals who are 
currently involved in concrete activities to start 

up a new business (start-ups),
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The level of early stage entrepreneurship 

activity in 2010 was 8.6% which means that about 9 

out of every 100 adults in Turkey were entrepreneurs 

according to the “GEM definition”. When compared 

with 2008, 2010 reflects a more positive outlook 

for entrepreneurship in Turkey. In 2008, among 

our respondents, 6% were identified as being 

involved in entrepreneurial activity; thus, six out 

of every 100 adults in Turkey were entrepreneurs. 

The number of individuals actively looking for 

and taking advantage of business opportunities 

increased from 2008 to 2010. This also indicates that 

Turkey had a higher proportion of entrepreneurs in 

2010 compared to 2008 among “similar” phases of 

economic development included in the GEM study. 

However, the average TEA rate of Turkey (8.6%) is 

still below the average rate of all GEM efficiency-

driven economies included in 2010 (11.7%). 

Table 1: Prevalence rates (in %) of entrepreneurial activity across 
GEM Efficiency-driven economies in 2010, for those aged 18-64

 
Nascent 
entrepreneurship 
rate

Ranking  

New 
business 
ownership 
rate

Ranking  
Early-stage 
entrepreneurial 
activity (TEA)

Ranking

Peru 22.1 1 Colombia 12.7 1 Peru 27.2 1

Montenegro 12.0 2 Brazil 11.8 2 Ecuador 21.3 2

Chile 11.1 3 Ecuador 11.5 3 Colombia 20.6 3

Ecuador 10.4 4 China 10.0 4 Brazil 17.5 4

Costa Rica 10.4 5 Argentina 7.4 5 Chile 16.8 5

Trinidad and 
Tobago

8.9 6
Trinidad and 
Tobago

6.4 6
Trinidad and 
Tobago

15.1 6

Mexico 8.6 7 Chile 6.1 7 Montenegro 14.9 7

Colombia 8.6 8 Peru 6.0 8 China 14.4 8

Uruguay 7.8 9 Turkey 5.1 9 Argentina 14.2 9

Argentina 7.0 10 Tunisia 4.4 10 Costa Rica 13.5 10

Brazil 5.8 11 Latvia 4.2 11 Uruguay 11.7 11

Latvia 5.6 12 Uruguay 4.1 12 Mexico 10.5 12

South Africa 5.1 13
Bosnia and 
Herzegovina

4.1 13 Latvia 9.7 13

Taiwan 4.7 14 South Africa 3.9 14 South Africa 8.9 14

Hungary 4.6 15 Taiwan 3.8 15 Turkey 8.6 15

China 4.6 16 Macedonia 3.6 16 Taiwan 8.4 16

Macedonia 4.4 17 Malaysia 3.6 17 Macedonia 8.0 17

Bosnia and 
Herzegovina

4.1 18 Costa Rica 3.6 18
Bosnia and 
Herzegovina

7.7 18

Croatia 3.8 19 Montenegro 3.1 19 Hungary 7.1 19

Turkey 3.7 20 Hungary 2.6 20 Tunisia 6.1 20

Romania 3.3 21 Mexico 2.0 21 Croatia 5.5 21

Russia 2.1 22 Croatia 1.9 22 Malaysia 5.0 22

Tunisia 1.7 23 Russia 1.9 23 Romania 4.3 23

Malaysia 1.4 24 Romania 1.1 24 Russia 3.9 24

 Average 6.7    Average 5.2    Average 11.7  

Source: Adult population survey 2010 (APS)
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Start-Up and New Firm 
Participation 

As mentioned earlier, GEM distinguishes 

between two stages of entrepreneurial activity: start-

ups and new firms. The respondent is considered to 

be involved in a start-up if he or she has undertaken 

any activity to start a firm in the past 12 months and 

has not paid salaries or wages for more than three 

months. The respondent is considered to engage in 

new firm activity when he or she currently owns or 

partly owns a firm which has paid wages or salaries 

for between 3 and 42 months. 

In Figure 4, we show the percentage of Turkish 

adults who were involved in start-up and new firm 

activity respectively in 2008 and 2010. We also 

compare the Turkey’s results with other efficiency-

driven economies(Table 1). 

During 2010, 3.69 % of the adult population in 

Turkey was actively trying to start a business (nascent 

entrepreneurs). Although, Turkey has had lower than 

average start up rates (6.7%) for efficiency-driven 

countries, we experienced slightly higher start up 

entrepreneurial activity over 2008 (3.19%). The 

increased proportion of nascent entrepreneurs can be 

considered as an indicator for new business activity 

in the future, especially when global economic 

circumstances get better. When we compare Turkey’s 

start-up rates with other efficiency-driven economies, 

Turkey is in fifth-from-last position for start-up types 

of entrepreneurial activity. In fact, the start-up rate of 

Turkey is much lower than the average (6.7%). 

On the other hand, 5.05% of the adult population 

in Turkey were owner-managers of businesses from 

3-42 months old (new businesses) in 2010. There is 

an increase in the share of young business owners 

relative to the adult population of 2010 compared 

with 2008 (3.01%). Turkey is in ninth position 

among the efficiency-driven countries. The increase 

in the prevalence of new business may reflect an 

improvement in economic growth. 

The ratio of new firms to start ups could also 

show the survival rates of starts ups. This ratio has 

been increased from 0.94 in 2008 to 1.36 in 2010, 

suggesting that in Turkey many businesses progress 

beyond the start-up phase. The survival and growth 

of new business might have a positive effect on 

overall economic development. Start-ups help to 

redress employment needs in the country.

Established Business 
An established business is where the owner/

manager has operated the business, has been paying 
wages and salaries or any other payment, for 
more than 42 months. The high rate of established 
business ownership shows positive circumstances 
for firm survival and also can be interpreted as an 
index for the general stability and sustainability of 
businesses (GEM, 2010, p. 36). The prevalence rate 
for established businesses for 2010 was 10.73%, a 
noticeable expansion over 2008 which recorded only 
4.82% (Figure 4). This indicates that between 2010 
and 2008, 5.91% of early stage entrepreneurs were 
transformed into established businesses. 

The survival rate of start-ups and growth of 
new business into established businesses in Turkey 
increased over 2008. This could show increasing 
stability and/or sustainability of business activities 
in Turkey, which is very important for creating and 
sustaining employment and economic well being. 

Exits by Entrepreneurs 
GEM tracks the number of individuals who have 

sold or closed their businesses in the last 12 months. 

The total number selling and closing their businesses 

is considered an exit rate. Turkey recorded 4.64% of 

entrepreneurs who exited their businesses in 2010. 

Entrepreneurial activity should be assessed not only 

by the number of new entries into the market but 

also by the number of those exiting the market. The 

nascent entrepreneurs who were involved in creating 

new business, equating with 3.7%, are fewer than 

those equating with the exit rate.
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 The number of entrepreneurs who exit the 

market exceeded the number of entrepreneurs who 

entered the market in Turkey in 2010, which may 

show that the expansion of entrepreneurship is 

insignificant. 

Understanding the reasons for business 

discontinuation is important for entrepreneurship. 

It may help policymakers deal with problems that 

entrepreneurs face in order to achieve entrepreneurial 

sustainability. 
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Figure 5: Reasons behind Discontinuous Business

Figure 5 shows the reasons stated by 
entrepreneurs for quitting their businesses activities. 
Although the reasons for business discontinuation 
are various: unprofitability, difficulties with access 
to finance and personal factors are important reasons 
for discounting business in Turkey. 

“The business was not profitable” was the main 
reason indicated for exiting the market in 2008; 
a full 47% of respondents cited this as the reason. 
However, “problem getting finance” was the main 
reason to exit the market in 2010. Most likely, 
attracting additional financing after the recession 
and problems securing finance were important for 
the viability of businesses in 2010. 

esra
Yapışkan Not
kutu içindeki ilk kelimeler ya küçük harf yada büyük harf ile baslasın

esra
Yapışkan Not
şekil başlıkları farklı büyüklüklerde galiba



25

Opportunity and Necessity 
Entrepreneurs in Turkey

necessity entrepreneurs in Turkey and the same 

indicators for the efficiency-driven countries, 

respectively. It is important to note that the 

opportunity entrepreneurship index and the necessity 

entrepreneurship index do not add up exactly to the 

TEA index, since some entrepreneurs say they are 

motivated by something other than opportunity or 

necessity or by a combination of factors. However, 

these figures show all respondents that can be 

assigned to either the opportunity or necessity 

category.

In Turkey, the entrepreneurial pool was made up 

of about 60% opportunity-entrepreneurs and 40% 

necessity-entrepreneurs in 2010. In terms of the actual 

prevalence rates for the two types of entrepreneurship, 

4.65% of the Turkish adult population was involved 

in entrepreneurial activity based on opportunities, 

whereas 3.21 % of the population was involved in 

such activity by necessity. Although there has been 

an increase in opportunity-entrepreneurs, this rate 

is well below the average of the efficiency-driven 

countries (7.81%) and 17th out of the 24 efficiency-

driven countries. The necessity-entrepreneur rate 

in Turkey remained relatively high in 2010, and 

Entrepreneurs who consider starting a new 

business may be motivated by various factors. Some 

start their businesses in order to take advantage of 

particular business opportunities; others are forced 

by necessity to start up a business because they 

do not have other real sources of income. Thus, 

GEM makes a distinction between entrepreneurs 

who say they are pursuing a business opportunity 

(i.e., opportunity-entrepreneurship-TEA-OPP) and 

those who say they are involved in entrepreneurial 

activity because they have no other choice of work 

(necessity-entrepreneurship-TEA-NEC). 

Opportunity and necessity entrepreneurs may 

differ with respect to performance. It has been argued 

that opportunity entrepreneurship is more likely to 

make a greater contribution to the economy in terms 

of innovation and job creation (Reynolds et al., 

2002). Opportunity-entrepreneurs expect to start new 

ventures that create jobs. Necessity-entrepreneurs 

expect their new firms to create relatively few jobs, 

or remain vehicles of self employment only.

The Figures 6 and 7 show the opportunity and 

necessity indices and the ratio of opportunity to 
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this rate is close to the average for the efficiency-

driven countries (3.58%); Turkey is situated 12th out 

of the 24 countries considered. Not surprisingly, in 

Turkey limited income, high unemployment, and a 

weak social welfare system force Turkish people to 

attempt to start a business from what they deem to be 

necessary for survival.

The ratio of opportunity to necessity driven 

early stage entrepreneurship remained relatively low 

in 2010 for Turkey at 1.45%, a slight dip from 1.51% 

in 2008. This ranks Turkey 21st out of 24 countries. 

Turkey has a less favorable ratio of opportunity to 

necessity driven early stage entrepreneurs. However, 

the improved ranking of Turkey in terms of the ratio 

of opportunity- to necessity-entrepreneurship is very 

significant. This is because opportunity-type start-

ups have the best chance of leading to further growth 

and job creation. 

Figure 6: % Rate of Opportunity- and Necessity-Entrepreneurship in Turkey

Figure 7: Opportunity and Necessity Early-Stage Entrepreneurship
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 O223NE4 ra6o 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Motivation-Gender
Regarding gender difference, it seems that 

there is more gender distinction in opportunity-
entrepreneurship than in necessity-entrepreneurship. 
Figure 8 shows that the proportion of females who 
set up a business from necessity is increasing at a 
higher rate than those of males participation. This 

is the case even as male participation in necessity-
entrepreneurship rate is increasing as well. 
Traditionally, women are assumed to have lower 
levels of human capital because they are more likely 
to work part-time or drop out of the labor force 
after having children (Becker 1993). Women who 
have a higher education usually prefer to work for 
somebody else rather than set up their own business. 

Figure 8: Gender Participation in Necessity- and Opportunity-Entrepreneurship TEA Rate
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 TEA‐0pp‐Female 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 TEA‐Nec‐Female 
TEA‐Opp/Nec 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2008  5,61  1,29 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 1,15  1,65  1,12 

2010 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 1,74  4,65 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 1,62  0,99 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Motivation-Education
Education level covaries with unemployment. 

It may be expected that people with a low level 

of education have more difficulties finding a job, 

and therefore see no other option than in place of 

necessity-entrepreneurship. Evidence from the GEM 

research finding for Turkey (Figure 9) suggests that 

people who have attained higher levels of education 

tend to be opportunity-driven entrepreneurs. These 

people tend to have wider choices for employment. 

Accordingly, they have little desire to take risks 

by starting their own business until they perceive 

an obvious potential gain from a new business. 

Conversely, people who have comparatively lower 

levels of education start their own business because 

they have fewer choices for suitable employment. 

Such entrepreneurs are driven by the necessity of 

their own economic circumstances. Opportunity-

entrepreneurs are non-existent among the illiterate. 

On the other hand, necessity-entrepreneurial activity 

is non-existent for people who have a high level of 

education (i.e., graduate experience). 
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Motivation-Income

The GEM data for household income are 

classified according to three equal percentages 

of income groups: lowest 33%, middle 33%, and 

highest 33%. Figure 10 shows that, people who are at 

the lowest and middle income levels start a business 

because of necessity. Conversely, for the highest 

income level; people tend to be opportunity-driven 

entrepreneurs. 

Since opportunity-entrepreneurs may have more 

resources to invest in the human and social capital 

necessary to start a business which may lead to higher 

earnings than necessity-driven business earnings. 

An opportunity-entrepreneur is more likely to have 

recognized an opportunity for making profits, while 

necessity-entrepreneurs may simply have had no 

better choice. Opportunity-entrepreneurs earn more 

than necessity-entrepreneurs, therefore suggesting 

a stronger positive impact from them on economic 

growth. 

Figure 9: Education Level of Necessity and Opportunity-Entrepreneurs (%)

Figure10: Income Level of Necessity- and Opportunity-Entrepreneurs (%)
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Motivation-growth aspiration
Necessity and opportunity entrepreneurs differ 

in their growth aspirations in that opportunity 
entrepreneurs want to grow faster. In Turkey, 27.9% 

of opportunity-entrepreneurs expect to create more 
than 20 jobs, whereas only 14.9% of necessity-
entrepreneurs have these expectations. Opportunity-
entrepreneurship is more likely to make a higher 
contribution to the economy in terms of job creation.

Figure11: Growth Aspiration of Necessity- and Opportunity-Entrepreneurs (%)
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Social and Demographic 
Characteristics of Turkish 
Entrepreneurs

Social and economic characteristics such as 
age, gender, education and income have significant 
effect on the desire to start a business. In this section, 
we take a closer look at what kind of people start 
companies and in which sectors of an economy their 
start-up businesses fall. We also examine changes in 
the social and demographic characteristics of Turkish 
entrepreneurs occurring between 2008 and 2010.

Gender and Entrepreneurship 
GEM data show that, worldwide, more men 

are acting as entrepreneurs than women. Consistent 
with this pattern in other countries, almost 70 % of 
all entrepreneurs in Turkey are men (Figure 12). The 
good news is that both the male and female TEA-index 
increased in 2010, to 13.45% for men and 3.67% for 
women, respectively. The ratio of male to female 
entrepreneurs decreases slightly from 2008 to 2010. 

Figure 12: Male and Female TEA- Index
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However, the ratio of male to female for Turkey 
is the most disadvantageous for the latter among the 
efficiency-driven countries (Figure 13). Male TEA 
rates are 3.63 times higher that female TEA rates. 
The lowest female participation rate for Turkey 
among the efficiency-driven countries shows for 

every 100 male entrepreneurs there are 28 female 
counterparts. Clearly, stimulating entrepreneurship 
in Turkey has paid off for men, but not for women. 
More effort needs to be made to encourage women to 
become entrepreneurs. 

Figure 13: Ratio of Male to Female for Efficiency-driven Countries in 2010
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The GEM data show that gender attitudes differ 

about entrepreneurship. A higher percentage of men 

as opposed to women see favorable opportunities 

in the business environment for starting companies. 

Men are also more confident that they possess the 

knowledge and experience necessary to start a new 

business, and they have less fear of failure. Men also 

have more resources from social networks and know 

more people who started a business than do women. 

Age and Entrepreneurship
For most parts of the world, the largest group of 

entrepreneurs is between 25 and 34 years old. GEM 

2010 data for Turkey reveal somewhat different 

results (Figure 14). In comparison with 2008, the 

share of the 25-34 age group declined significantly. 

Furthermore, the business activities of the 18-24 age 

group decreased, albeit slightly, in comparison with 

2008. These trends may be due to an increase in the 

share of the 35-44 and the 45-54 age groups. In 2010, 

the popularity of entrepreneurship among a middle 

age population (35-44 and 45-54) increased, and older 

persons were involved in early stage entrepreneurial 

activities than were in 2008. No significant changes 

are found for the 55-64 age group. 

Increasing the educational level of entrepreneurs 

might help to explain the change seen with regard to 

age distribution in Turkey for 2010. Individuals have 

tended to spend longer periods of time period devoted 

to their education. In addition, data show that Turks 

prefer to work for established companies or in public 

companies before becoming entrepreneurs. 
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According to figures from the Turkish Statistics 
Institute (TUIK), half of the Turkish population is 
under 29 years old, and the unemployment rate 
among Turkish youth is 21.6 percent. In other words, 
one out of every five young persons in Turkey is 

unemployed. This indicates that much more effort 
needs to be made on behalf of young people who 
might contemplate becoming entrepreneurs; we 
should encourage our young people to choose 
entrepreneurship as a career path.

Figure 14: Age Distribution of TEA in Turkey (%)
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Education and Entrepreneurship 
Education is vital to the successful development 

of entrepreneurship within society. Figure 15 shows 
the distribution of education levels for early-stage 
entrepreneurs in 2008 and 2010. The proportion of 
university and post-graduate degree entrepreneurs 
increased compared to 2008. Earlier, we showed 
that those people attaining higher levels of education 
tend to be opportunity-driven entrepreneurs. 

On the other hand, the data show an increase 
in the proportion of entrepreneurs who have less 
education. Again we found that Turkish people 
who have received comparatively lower levels of 
education start their own businesses because they 
have less of a choice regarding suitable employment. 
Such entrepreneurs are driven by necessity to try to 
improve their economic circumstances. 
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Household Income and 
Entrepreneurship 

Consistent with international findings, Turkish 

people in the highest household income brackets are 

more likely to start a new company (Figure 16). 76 

% of Turkish entrepreneurs are found in the highest 

33% income level, 17% percent are found in the 

middle 33% income level, and only 8% of Turkish 

entrepreneurs come from the lowest 33% income 

level. Clearly, starting a company if one’s household 

income is low is difficult. Special attention should be 

paid to these low-income earners.

Figure 15: Distribution of Education Levels for Early-Stage Entrepreneurs in 2008 and 2010

Figure 16: Entrepreneurial Activity by Income 
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Entrepreneurial Activity by Sector
The GEM study classified sectors according to 

the international standard of industrial classification. 
These include the consumer industries, and the 
business services, transforming (manufacturing and 
construction) and extraction industries (farming, 
forestry, fishing and mining) industries. In most of the 
countries included in the GEM-study, entrepreneurial 
activities dominated in the consumer-oriented 
services. As an economy becomes more developed, 
the share of consumer-oriented services becomes 
less prevalent and the share of business-oriented 
services becomes more important. 

Figure 17 shows that the most entrepreneurial 
activity in Turkey took place in the consumer-

oriented sector. However, there was a significant 
increase in the consumer-oriented sector from 
2008 to 2010 and a decrease in the other sectors, 
especially with regard to the transforming industry 
(manufacturing, and construction), where the 
percentage of entrepreneurial activity dropped from 
34% to 20%. In fact, according to TUIK data, there 
was a decrease trending in the manufacturing and 
construction industry. Possibly this decrease came 
about because of unfavorable global conditions, in 
general. In 2010, the most start-ups were focused 
on end users of the goods and services provided, for 
which the businesses concerned do not need as much 
startup capital.

 

Figure 17: Early-Stage Entrepreneurial Activity by Industry Type
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Entrepreneurial Attitudes and 
Perception of Turkish People 

(4)	 the extent to which one is reluctant to be 

involved in entrepreneurial activity because of 

fear of failure.

First, opportunity recognition is the basic 

condition of entrepreneurial action. Kirzner (1973) 

defined entrepreneurs as those who are alert to 

discovering and exploiting opportunities and to 

acting upon them. In order to capture the extent to 

which one perceives entrepreneurial opportunities, 

the GEM study asks the respondents whether “they 

saw good opportunities for starting a business in 

the next six months in the area where they lived”.’ 

Figure 18 shows that the Turkish respondents felt 

that there were good opportunities for start-ups; 

36.14 % of the Turkish respondents held this belief. 

This figure is lower than the average for efficiency-

driven countries of 42.94%. 

Entrepreneurship is about people. Therefore, 

it is important to understand personal perceptions 

and judgments about environments which are 

significantly correlated with an individual’s decision 

to start a new business (Arenius and Minniti, 2005). 

Perception of Turkish people
GEM measures the following perceptions that 

are important for the entrepreneurial process:

(1)	 the extent to which one perceives that there are 

opportunities within the environment;

(2)	 the extent to which one believes his/her skills are 

capable of starting a new enterprise;

(3)	 the extent to which one knows entrepreneurs 

who can serve as role models within a personal 

network;
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More than half of the population (54%) believed 

that they possessed the skills necessary to start a new 

business. This level of self-belief by Turkish people 

represents an increase compared with the previous 

survey year, for which the figure was 49%. Therefore, 

it appears to be the case that Turks are more confident 

and positive with regard to the skills required to 

start up a new business. Individual self-confidence, 

defined as individuals’ belief in their capability to 

perform a task, influences the development of both 

entrepreneurial intentions and actions or behaviors 

(Byod and Vozikis ,1994).

More Turkish people believe they have the skills 

to start a business than believe that there are good 

business opportunities, which is to say that Turkish 

people are pessimistic about business opportunities. 

However, the Turkish experts seem to think that this 

pessimism has more to do with a lack in the capacity 

to recognize opportunities rather than with an actual 

lack of opportunities. 

The opinion of our experts about the population’s 

entrepreneurial abilities was negative in respect to the 

ability to start and manage a high-growth business, 

the experience necessary to start a new business, 

and the capability to organize resources required for 

a new business. These results draw attention to the 

need for policy makers to concentrate on developing 

entrepreneurial capacity, which has to do with the 

ability to respond to business opportunities. 

Moreover, the Turkish people appear to 

believe that there is no change in the degree of 

entrepreneurial opportunities in Turkey from 2008 to 

2010. People feel that the economy is not providing 

more opportunities for them. 

On the other hand, the Turkish experts 

were generally optimistic about the existence of 

opportunities in Turkey. This said the general 

population does not appear to share this optimism. 

Most of the experts mentioned that they believed 

there will be plentiful and good opportunities for 

starting up new businesses in the next six months; 

but only 36% of the general Turkish population said 

the same. 

Second, possession of knowledge, skills and 

experience is also deemed important to the successful 

start-up of a new business. If people believed they 

possessed the necessary skills, those individuals 

might be more inclined to pursue entrepreneurship. 

The GEM study asked respondents whether “they 

had the knowledge, skill and experience required to 

start a new business.” Figure 18 shows the percentage 

of adults who responded, “yes,” to this question. 

As can be seen, Turkey ranks in the middle among 

efficiency-driven countries: 54.18% of the Turkish 

respondents believed they had the skills necessary 

for a successful start-up. This figure is slightly lower 

than the average of 55.86%.for the efficiency-driven 

countries. 
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Figure 18: Perceptions of Turkish People about Entrepreneurial Environment
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due to lack of other opportunities in the labor market 

because of high unemployment.

The Attitude of Turks towards 
Entrepreneurship

The attitude toward entrepreneurship which 
reflects society’s view of entrepreneurship is an 
important precondition for entrepreneurial activity. 
Developing entrepreneurial capacity is not about 
skills alone, but also about creating a motivating 
environment. 

GEM measures the following attitudes 
towards entrepreneurship that are important for the 
entrepreneurial process: 

(1)	 starting business is a good career choice;

(2)	 starting a new business gains a high level of 
status and respect;

(3)	 media publicity is important for a new business.

The first point assesses the percentage of adults 
who feel that in their country, starting a new business 
is considered a desirable career choice. In 2010, 71 
% of Turkish people considered opening one’s own 
firm to be a desirable career choice. Figure 19 shows 
that there is no change in national attitudes about 
entrepreneurship as a successful career choice in 
Turkey from 2008 to 2010. 

The choice of an entrepreneurial career might be 
affected by other employment opportunities in the 
country. This might explain why this indicator is so 
low in Japan (28%) and so high in Ghana (91%)

The second indicator refers to public opinion 
about entrepreneurship: Do entrepreneurs occupy a 
high social status or are they generally not seen as role 
models within the society? Over 76 % of the adult 
population believes that successful entrepreneurs are 
held in high esteem. Although that figure represents a 
decline from 80% in 2008 to 76% in 2010, the result 
is still higher than the average for efficiency-driven 

countries (69.8%). 

Third, networks of relationships with others and 

successful role models may affect entrepreneurial 

decisions of people. Knowledge gained from such 

networks provides information about opportunities 

to the individuals who might think about starting 

their own business. 

In order to assess the viability of networks of 

relationships with others, the respondents were 

asked whether “they knew someone personally who 

had started a business in the past two years.” The 

results are presented in Figure 18. These indicate 

that 36.43% of those asked this question responded 

positively. This figure is lower than the average score 

for the efficiency-driven countries (45.34%). 

The data show that for the Turkish respondents 

who saw good opportunities for starting a business 

in the next six months in the area where they lived, 

all knew someone personally who had started a 

business in the past two years. On the other hand, 

72% of respondents who did not belong to an 

entrepreneurship network were unable to envisage 

good opportunities for starting up a business. This 

shows clearly that networks are important because 

they provide information about opportunities, and 

help to strengthen and support a given business. 

Fourth, fear of failure is an important factor that 

negatively affects entrepreneurial activity. Many 

people who choose not to become entrepreneurs 

are afraid of failing, that is, of making mistakes and 

losing money. However, business failure must be 

accepted as a natural risk in the process and should 

be perceived as being a valuable learning experience 

instead of something of which we should be ashamed 

and for which we should be punished. 

In 2010, 33% of Turkish people mentioned 

that fear of failure prevented them from starting 

up a business. This figure is slightly lower than the 

average for efficiency-driven countries of 35%. At 

the same time, the percentage of those in Turkey 

deterred by fear of failure decreased about 3% by 

comparison with 2008. Most likely this decline was 
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opportunities. This measure is very close to the 

average found in efficiency-driven countries (62.5%) 

and the value for the year 2008 (62.8%) in Turkey. 

The leaders with regard to this indicator among 

the efficiency-driven countries are Peru and Brazil, 

where this value is 81 %.

The third indicator relates to the popularity of 

entrepreneurship and asks for respondents’ opinions 

on the media coverage for new businesses in the 

country. In 2010, 62 % of Turkish mentioned that 

the media gave significant attention to highlighting 

entrepreneurs’ activities and to describing business 

Figure 19: Attitudes to Entrepreneurship in Turkish Society
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Support for Entrepreneurship in Turkey
The model assumes that all firms are affected by 

national characteristics, and is referred to as the 

Entrepreneurial Framework Conditions (EFC). 

The GEM model identifies the structural 

condition of the socio-economic factors that 

affect the development of entrepreneurial activity. 

EFC1-Financial support: the availability of financial resources, equity and debt for new and growing firms, 
including grants and subsidies.

EFC2-Government policies: the extent to which government policies, reflected in taxes or regulations or the 
application of either, are either size-neutral or encourage new and growing firms.

EFC3-Government programs: the presence of direct programs to assist new

and growing firms at all levels of government (national, regional and municipal).

EFC4-Education and training: the extent to which training in creating or managing small, new or growing 
business is incorporated within the educational and training systems at all levels.

EFC5-Research & development transfer: the extent to which national research and development will lead to 
new commercial opportunities, and whether or not these are available for new, small and growing firms.

EFC6-Commercial and Professional infrastructure: the presence of commercial, accounting, and other 
legal services and institutions that allow or promote the emergence of new, small or growing businesses.

EFC7-Market Openness: the extent to which commercial arrangements are prevented from undergoing 
constant change and redeployment, thus preventing new and growing firms from competing and replacing 
existing suppliers, sub-contractors and consultants.

EFC8-Access to the physical infrastructure: the ease of access to available physical resources – 
communication, utilities, transportation, land or space at a price that does not discriminate against new, small 
and growing firms.

EFC9-Cultural and social norms: the extent to which existing social and cultural norms encourage, or do not 
encourage, individual actions that may lead to new ways of conducting business or economic activities and, in 
turn, that lead to a greater dispersion in wealth and income.

The nine entrepreneurial framework conditions are:

esra
Yapışkan Not
bosluk kalmış, cümleyi buradan devam ettirebiliriz.
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than (3) is negative and more than (3) is positive. 

The responses to these 5-point scale questions have 

been standardized to a scale of -2 to + 2 for graphical 

representation. 

As should be apparent from Table 2, the majority 

of assessments are below 3, i.e., these factors do 

not facilitate development of entrepreneurship. 

The experts gave their most positive assessment to 

attitudes towards entrepreneurship, market openness 

with the speed of change in the market, and ease of 

access to physical infrastructure. 

The data on entrepreneurial framework 

conditions were collected through an extensive 

questionnaire which was completed by 36 experts. 

Our experts included academics, entrepreneurs, 

government officials, business development 

advisors and other professionals concerned with 

entrepreneurship.

The experts evaluated framework conditions on 

a five-point scale, ranging from (1) to (5), indicating 

strong disagreement to strong agreement; a score of 

(3) is read as neutral, implying that any score less 

Table 2: Entrepreneurial Framework Conditions

Entrepreneurial framework conditions 2008 2010 Change

Financial environment related with entrepreneurship 1.94 2.06 0.12 h

Government concrete policies, priority and support 2.1 2.57 0.47 h

Government policies bureaucracy, taxes 2.18 2.22 0.04 h

Government programs 1.98 2.21 0.23 h

Entrepreneurial level of education at Primary and Secondary 1.87 2.21 0.34 h

Entrepreneurial level of education at Vocational, and University 2.66 2.52 -0.14 i

R&D level of transference 2.01 2.37 0.36 h

Professional and commercial infrastructure access 2.76 2.77 0.01 h

Internal market dynamics 3.36 3.68 0.32 h

Physical infrastructures and services access 3.33 3.33 g

Cultural, social norms and society support 2.78 2.06 -0.72 i

Attitude towards entrepreneurship  3.63 3.7 0.07 h

Overall, the experts indicated belief that 
there was improvement for more than half of the 
framework conditions for 2010 in comparison 
with 2008, with the exceptions of entrepreneurial 
education at vocational schools and universities, and 
of the national culture. 

In the following section we examine each 
condition, find out its changes in Turkey, and 
compare Turkey to other efficiency-driven countries 
participating in GEM.
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business angels, of venture capital and of initial 

public offerings.

The most significant problem for firms is 

providing the collateral necessary to get loans from 

the banking sector. In addition, certain businesses are 

unable to obtain debt financing because they do not 

have sufficient cash flow to service repayments. The 

experts mentioned that equity finance is an important 

source of operating capital for firms, particularly 

those that have strong and rapid growth prospects; 

equity financing is suitable for the early, pre-revenue 

stages of company development. Overall opinion 

in Turkey affirms that although the availability 

of resources is increasing there continues to be 

insufficent financial support for entrepreneurs.

Financial Support
Financial support refers to the availability of 

funding for entrepreneurship. Financial resources 

are categorized according to the availability of debt 

and equity funding, government subsidies, business 

angels, venture capital and initial public offerings. 

Availability of funding in Turkey has been 

changing over the years (Figure 20). Resources seem 

to have increased slightly over the years. According 

to the experts, the most increases were seen with 

regard to the availabilty of debt and equtiy funding 

over the years. However, there are mixed views 

with regard to government subsidies, even as and 

there has been some increase in the availability of 

Availability of funding is also measured in the 
other efficiency-driven countries participating in 
GEM (Figure 21). Internationally, experts polled 
from three other GEM countries reflect the belief 
that the availability of finance for entrepreneurs in 
their countries is adequate. Among the efficiency-
driven countries, Malaysia, Taiwan, and Tunisia 

have the greatest availability, and Costa Rica, Russia 
and Macedonia the lowest. Turkey is fourth from the 
bottom. To summarize, availability of resources in 
Turkey has been increasing in recent years; however, 
Turkey still remains at the low end among efficiency-
developed countries.

Figure 20: Financial Support for New Firms
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business, are a problem for new and growing firms 
in Turkey. 

Government support policies towards 
entrepreneurship have been changing (Figure 22). 
Over the years, the Turkish government has become 
more supportive and supporting policies have 
become more favorable. Turkey’s political stability 
is seen as an important positive contribution to 
encouraging entrepreneurship. 

Government Policies 
Government policies are rated in two sections. 

First, the government supports policy, which all 

levels of government (national, regional, municipal) 

considers new and growing firms a high priority. 

Second, government regulation policies, which 

pertain to the tax and administrative burden on 

Figure 21: Financial Support of Efficiency Driven Countries to New Firms
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Figure 22: Government Support Policies for New Firms
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Mexico, and Malaysia. Turkey is in the middle, with 
half of the other countries above and the other half 
below. 

Where is Turkey positioned compared to other 
efficiency-driven countries? Figure 23 shows that 
among the efficiency-driven countries, government 
support polices are especially extensive in Tunisia, 

believe that these burdens have lifted only slightly 
during the last few years. This is still a key area of 
complaint among the experts. 

Second, the government regulation policies 
regarding the tax and administrative burdens remain 
a problem for new and growing firms in Turkey. 
While the general trend is positive, the experts 

Figure 23: Government Support Policies in Efficiency-Driven Countries for New Firms
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Figure 24: Government Regulation Policy

‐2 

‐1 

0 

1 

2 

2006  2007  2008  2010 

S
tr

e
n

g
th

 o
f 

O
p

in
io

n
 

N
e
g

a
ti

v
e
 P

o
s
it

iv
e
 



44 Entrepreneurship in Turkey 2010 The Global Entrepreneurship Monitor (GEM)

40% are less supportive. In short, supportiveness 

of government policies has increased slightly, even 

though Turkey still ranks no higher than the middle 

among the efficiency-driven countries.

Where is Turkey positioned compared to other 

efficiency-driven countries in terms of supportive 

regulation policies? Among these countries, 56% 

of countries are more supportive than Turkey and 

centralization of the diverse kinds of government 

assistance and whether an adequate number of 

government programs exist for new and growing 

firms. However, Turkish experts still express negative 

opinions as to the effectiveness of government 

programmers to provide adequate support for new 

and growing firms and with regard, as well, to the 

competence and effectiveness of the personnel 

working within government agencies. 

Government Programs
Government programs refer to the presence 

and efficiency of direct programs to assist new and 

growing firms at all levels of government (national, 

regional, and municipal).

Generally, confidence in government programs 

has been increasing since 2007. Turkish experts 

have been more positive in their opinions as to the 

Figure 25: Government Regulation Policy of Efficiency Driven Countries

Figure 26: Government Programs
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are Tunisia, Taiwan, Uruguay, Mexico and Malaysia. 

Although the efficacy of government programs 

in Turkey has been growing over the years, these 

indices remain significantly below the mean when 

compared to other countries. 

Where does the increase bring Turkey, in 

comparison with other efficiency- driven countries? 

Experts from five countries express positive opinions 

with regard to government programs that provide 

adequate and effective support to new firms: these 

Turkish experts have given a better rating in 

2010 than in previous years regarding the general 

school education in primary and secondary education 

and consider that Turkish schools do encourage more 

creativity, self-sufficiency, and personal initiative 

and also provide more information about market 

economic principles and pay more attention to 

entrepreneurship. 

Education and Training
Education and training refers to the 

educational and training systems at all levels that 
provide knowledge and skills for performing the 
entrepreneurial role. The role of Turkish education 
and training in promoting entrepreneurship is 
analyzed according to the primary and secondary 
education level and beyond the secondary education 
level (universities and vocational training). 

Figure 27: Government Programs of Efficiency-Driven Countries

Figure 28: Primary and Secondary Education
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polled believes that adequate attention is being paid 

to entrepreneurship. Among the efficiency-driven 

countries, Latvia, Taiwan, Malaysia, and Argentina, 

together with Turkey, are seen as having relatively 

more extensive entrepreneurial education than the 

other participant countries. 

Where does this increase in entrepreneurial 

education bring Turkey today, in comparisin to other 

efficiency-driven countries? Comparison shows that 

none of the participant countries’ experts, including 

Turkey, is satisfied with the teaching of basic 

knowledge necessary for future business careers in 

primary and secondary education. None of the experts 

downward trend, which indicates that there is not 

much change in the views of the experts. The main 

concern of the experts is that colleges, universities 

and vocational education systems are not providing 

good and adequate preparation for starting up and 

growing new firms. 

In contrast to the positive trends in primary 

and secondary educational systems related to 

entrepreneurship, the Turkish experts have a 

negative opinion about both the quality and 

quantity of university and vocational education in 

Turkey. Figure 29 shows that there has been a weak 

Figure 29: Primary and Secondary Education in Efficiency-Driven Countries
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Figure 30: Beyond Secondary Education
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their country’s education beyond the secondary 

level. It remains to be said that we need to ensure 

that entrepreneurship is supported throughout our 

educational systems. 

Where is Turkey positioned compared to other 

efficiency-driven countries in terms of education and 

training for entrepreneurship? At the tertiary level, 

only nine countries were rated positively. The Turkish 

experts expressed the third least dissatisfaction with 

innovation fields. In fact, research and development 

(R&D) Indicators confirm such progress. According 

to the Scientific and Technological Research Council 

of Turkey (TÜBİTAK), R&D spending, which was 

at TL4.5 billion in 2006, went up to TL 8.5 billion in 

2009. The ratio of R&D spending to Gross National 

Product (GNP) went up to 0.85 percent in 2009 from 

0.58 in 2006. Another important finding for R&D 

funding is that the private sector’s share of funding 

reached 41 percent in 2009. In 2009, the number of 

full-time equivalent R&D personnel reached 74,000.

Research and Development 
Transfer

Technology transfer refers to the transfer of 

new technology, science and other knowledge from 

universities and research institutions to new or 

growing firms.

The experts are more optimistic about this 

framework condition this year. There is an upward 

trend since 2008 which shows that Turkey has 

experienced progress in the science, technology and 

Figure 31: Beyond Secondary Education in Efficiency-Driven Countries
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Figure 32: Research and Development Transfer
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countries. Private innovative entrepreneurship in 

Turkey should be encouraged in order to facilitate 

the competitiveness of firms and to improve the 

innovation culture. 

Where does the increase bring Turkey, in 

comparison with other efficiency driven countries? 

As a marker, technology transfer is especially 

extensive in Taiwan. Turkey is a little above 

the middle compared to other efficiency-driven 

a weak downward trend, which may be interpreted 

to mean that there is not much change in the views 

of the experts. While the experts were relatively 

favorable in their assessment of the availability of 

good professional legal and accounting services, 

they were still very critical of the affordability of 

these services. 

The experts mentioned that it is relatively 

easy to obtain good banking services although the 

experts find the banking services are costly for small 

firms. Internet banking is lowering service fees and 

payment of wages electronically decreases the need 

for, and risk of, transporting large sums of cash.

Commercial and Professional 
Infrastructure

Commercial and professional Infrastructure 

refers to the availability and affordability of high 

quality suppliers, subcontractors and consultants for 

new or growing firms.

Overall, access to commercial and professional 

infrastructure in Turkey among the other 

entrepreneurial framework conditions has the fourth 

highest average score (3.32). The experts mentioned 

that access to physical infrastructure does not seem 

to be a major issue. The data show that there has been 

Figure 33: Research and Development Transfer in Efficiency Driven Countries
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Figure 34: Commercial and Professional Infrastructure
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in the consumer and business markets have occurred 

which are demonstrating the dynamism of the 

market. Nevertheless, the experts mentioned that 

the current global financial crisis has weakened the 

speed of the internal market. However, after 2008, 

Turkish markets regain dynamics; the current turmoil 

has been over. 

Internal market dynamics 
Internal market dynamics assess the speed 

of change in the market. Overall, among the other 

entrepreneurial framework conditions rapid market 

change has the highest average score (3.68) in 

Turkey. The experts opined that dramatic changes 

of Turkey with regard to the speed of change was 

above the average for the GEM sample and placed 

Turkey as high as fourth overall. Market dynamism 

increases opportunities for new start-ups.

How dynamic is the Turkish internal market in 

comparison with other efficiency-driven countries? 

Among these countries, Taiwan, China, Brazil 

and Turkey have relatively more dynamic internal 

markets than the other countries. The assessment 

Figure 35: Internal Market Dynamics
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Figure 36: Internal Market Dynamics in Efficiency Driven Countries
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availability and affordability, and speed of obtaining 

such infrastructure for new and growing firms. 
 Access to Physical Infrastructure

Physical Infrastructure refers to facilities for 

transportation, communication, utilities, their 

Entrepreneurial Culture 
National culture refers to the extent to which 

cultural norms encourage individuals to conduct 

business or economic activities. The experts think 

that the social and cultural norms in Turkey are not 

very supportive for entrepreneurship and that these 

norms have had an even more negative impact after 

2008.

 

Access to physical structure remains the second 

positive of the nine framework conditions in Turkey. 

The experts believe that new and growing firms 

can get good access to communications (telephone, 

internet, etc.) and to utilities (gas, electricity, and 

sewer) in a relatively short time. However, the 

experts concern about the energy costs and high 

energy taxes. The Turkish experts believe that access 

to physical structure has been consistently positive 

over the last four years and shows no significant sign 

of change, that is, for the worse. 

Figure 37: Access to physical Infrastructure
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Figure 38: Entrepreneurial Culture 
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entrepreneurship, the individuals develop a bright 

idea, create a rudimentary product, attract venture 

capital, establish a company to commercialize the 

product, sell the company or hold an initial public 

offering (IPO), and repeat the process. 

The experts affirmed that the attitude towards 

entrepreneurship in Turkey was higher than the GEM- 

and the developing countries’ average. Although 

Turkish national culture does not particularly 

encourage entrepreneurship, Turkish people have a 

positive attitude regarding entrepreneurship. 

The experts are increasingly negative with regard 

to the following points: first, Turkish national culture 

does not encourage entreprenurial risk-taking. 

Turkish people do not want to take a risk because 

failure is, for them, an unacceptable outcome. 

Second, national culture does not encourage 

creativity and innovation. Accordingly, young 

people are not equipped to develop bright ideas or 

to create a simple product. Furthermore, even the 

creative ones cannot be supported financially. In 

those countries that do have positive cultures for 

entrepreneurship. Experts also believe that starting 

up a new business is considered an appropriate way 

to become rich and that an entrepreneur is a desirable 

career. This positive attitude about entrepreneurship 

is very helpful for encouraging start-ups.

Experts believe that successful entrepreneurs 

are respected in Turkey. There has been recent and 

increasing emphasis on entrepreneurship in the 

media, with local newspapers, national papers and 

business magazines promoting and publicizing 

Figure 39: Attitude toward Entrepreneurship in Turkey
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Conclusion

for more than 42 months) in 2010 was 10.73%, a 

noticeable expansion over 2008, which recorded only 

4.82%. This indicates that between 2010 and 2008, 

5.91% of early stage entrepreneurs were transformed 

into established businesses. These data could show 

increasing stability and/or sustainability of business 

activities in Turkey, both factors very important for 

creating and sustaining employment and economic 

well being.

In terms of motivation, almost 1.43 times as many 

respondents cited opportunity (4.58%) as opposed 

to necessity (3.19%) as their reason for starting a 

business. This year’s results confirm the tendency that 

was observed in previous years regarding an increase 

in necessity-based entrepreneurs (from 1.79% in 

2006 to 1.98% in 2007, to 2.3% in 2008, to 3.19% 

in 2010), which also explains part of the increase in 

total early-stage entrepreneurship. As a result, the 

ratio of opportunity-to-necessity entrepreneurship 

is decreasing. Of opportunity entrepreneurs, 37.71% 

expect to create more than twenty jobs, whereas 

only 8.45% of necessity entrepreneurs have these 

expectations.

The entrepreneurial activity rate for males 

(13.39%) is 3.6 times higher than that for females 

(3.71%). Although there is a slight increase 

The worldwide slowdown in economic growth 

rates has provoked a dwindling of opportunities 

for new enterprises. However, Turkey is a growing 

economy, has a large and youthful population and 

buoyant consumer demand, all of which are the 

important factors that encourage entrepreneurship. 

GEM 2010 may provide some evidence that 

a dynamic growth process in Turkey has started. 

In 2010, 3.69% of the adult population in Turkey 

were actively trying to start a business (nascent 

entrepreneurs); 5.05% were owner-managers of a 

business that was 3-42 months old (new businesses). 

Early-stage entrepreneurial activity, the sum of the 

nascent entrepreneurship rate and the new business 

owner-manager rate was 8.52% in Turkey, higher 

than the average of 6% recorded for 2006–2008. 

However, the TEA rate of Turkey (8.6%) is lower 

than for countries falling in the same income range 

as Turkey (Brazil 17.5%, Mexico 10.5 %, Argentina 

14.5%), and lower than average compared with the 

efficiency-driven countries (11.7 %).

The survival rate of start-ups (nascent 

entrepreneurs), and the growth of new businesses 

into established businesses in Turkey have increased 

since 2008. The prevalence rate for established 

businesses (a business that is owned and managed 
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In the past, one of the most widely-circulated 

myths was that these were people “who were 

gifted, or were born to be entrepreneurs,” 

Nowadays, entrepreneurship is considered 

learnable through formal education and training. 

Including entrepreneurship education in the school 

system is very important and should be widely 

sought across the board. More students need to 

learn the elements of entrepreneurship. Through 

entrepreneurship education, self confidence of 

future businesspersons with respect to their ability 

to start up a new enterprise, to the understanding of 

financial and business issues, and to the desire to 

embark on entrepreneurial activity will be increased. 

Appropriate entrepreneurship education needs to be 

offered in all schools beginning with primary school. 

Dramatic improvements in the quantity and quality 

of entrepreneurship education are needed.

Raising the levels of entrepreneurial activity 

must come from increasing the proportion of people 

possessing the education required and in increasing 

the proportion of people who believe that they 

have the skills, knowledge and experience to start 

a business. These two factors go hand-in-hand, 

since higher levels of education are associated 

with significant increases in entrepreneurial self-

confidence.

In conclusion, entrepreneurship across the 

world is under pressure. Entrepreneurial activity 

in Turkey has endured relatively well despite the 

present unfavorable economic conditions. In the 

short run, government regulation policy and the 

financing of new businesses are important policy 

objectives. In the long run, raising entrepreneurial 

awareness through the educational system should be 

a fundamental concern. 

observed for 2010 in the number of active women 
as early-stage entrepreneurs, Turkey still has the 
fourth highest male/female ratio among the GEM 
participating countries and this ratio of male to female 
is increasing. Men are more likely than women 
to start a new firm due to business opportunity. 
While fewer women are involved in opportunity-
entrepreneurial activity, more women are involved 
in necessity-entrepreneurial activity. More females 
in entrepreneurship should be enlisted and more 
women encouraged choosing entrepreneurship.

People who have attained a low level of 
education are more likely to become self-employed 
out of necessity, whereas people with a higher 
level of education are more likely to engage in 
entrepreneurship because of a perceived business 
opportunity. 

From a policy perspective it is important to have 
insight into differences between opportunity- and 
necessity-entrepreneurs in order to develop specific 
programs to encourage entrepreneurship in these two 
groups.

GEM reports (2008) identified education and 
training as one of the entrepreneurial framework 
conditions that affects the levels of entrepreneurial 
attitudes, aspiration and activity, which then affect 
the level of new enterprises in the economy. The 
supply of people equipped to become entrepreneurs 
may be increased by improvements in education and 
training. 

The proportion of individuals who received some 
kind of training in starting a business, either in school 
or after school, is only 6% in Turkey - the lowest 
rate among efficiency-driven economies, as well as 
among all of the participating countries. Therefore, 
it must be concluded that entrepreneurship education 
and training in Turkey is very inadequate. 
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Desarrollo Pro 
O’Higgins
Univ. Católica del 
Maule
Univ. Católica 
de la Santísima 
Concepción
Univ. del 
Desarrollo
Univ. de la 
Frontera 
-INCUBATEC

José Ernesto Amorós
Carlos Poblete
Vesna Karmelic
Mauricio Vega
Gianni Romaní
Omar Gonzalez
Karla Soria
Cristóbal Fernández Robin
Jorge Cea Valencia
Juan Tapia
Cristina Betancour
Braulio Guzmán, Aracelly 
Tapia
Andrés Valenzuela, 
Alejandro Sottolichio
Jorge Espinoza
José Ernesto Amorós
Carlos Poblete 
Gerardo Lagos

InnovaChile de CORFO 
Área Emprendimiento, Liderazgo y TIC´s 
de la Universidad de Tarapacá
Gobierno Regional de Tarapacá
Universidad Católica del Norte, DGIP.
Gobierno Regional,
Agencia Regional Desarrollo Productivo.
CORFO, Agencia regional de Desarrollo 
Productivo.
Universidad Católica del Norte, 
Departamento de Industrias 
y Centro de Ingeniería de Mercados, 
CIMER, de la Univ. Técnica Federico 
Santa María
El Mercurio de Valparaíso
Universidad Mayor
Corporación de Desarrollo Pro O’Higgins
Universidad Católica del Maule
UCSC-Facultad de Ciencias Económicas 
y Adminitrativas
UDD-Facultad de Economía y Negocios.
Dirección de Innovación y Transferencia 
Tecnológica de la Universidad de La 
Frontera

Opina S.A.
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China Tsinghua 
University SEM

Gao Jian
Qin Lan
Jiang Yanfu
Cheng Yuan
Li Xibao

SEM Tsinghua University SINOTRUST 
International 
Information 
& Consulting 
(Beijing) Co., 
Ltd.

Colombia Universidad del 
Norte 
Pontificia 
Universidad 
Javeriana Cali 
Universidad de los 
Andes
Universidad Icesi

 Liyis Gómez Núñez
Piedad Martinez Carazo
César Figueroa
Fernando Pereira
Alberto Arias
Raúl Fernando Quiroga 
Rafael Augusto Vesga 
Diana Carolina Vesga

 Rodrigo Varela Villegas 
Luis Miguel Álvarez 
Juan David Soler Libreros

 

Universidad del Norte
Pontificia Universidad Javeriana Cali 
Universidad de los Andes
Universidad Icesi

Centro 
Nacional de
Consultoría

Costa Rica Asociación 
Incubadora Parque 
Tec (PARQUE 
TEC)
Universidad de 
Costa Rica (UCR)
Cámara de 
Industrias de Costa 
Rica (CICR)

Marcelo Lebendiker 
Fainstein
Petra Petry 
Rafael Herrera González
Guillermo Velásquez 
López

Banco Interamericano de Desarrollo / 
FOMIN
GTZ / Programa Desarrollo Económico 
Sostenible en Centroamérica (DESCA)
Banco Centroamericano de Integración 
Económica (BCIE)
Fundación CRUSA
Asociación Incubadora Parque Tec

IPSOS Central 
America

Croatia J.J. Strossmayer 
University in 
Osijek

Slavica Singer
Natasa Sarlija
Sanja Pfeifer
Suncica Oberman Peterka
Djula Borozan

Ministry of Economy, Labour and 
Entrepreneurship
SME Policy Centre – CEPOR, Zagreb
J.J. Strossmayer University in Osijek – 
Faculty of Economics, Osijek

Puls, d.o.o.,
Zagreb

Denmark University of 
Southern Denmark

Thomas Schøtt
Torben Bager
Kim Klyver
Hannes Ottossen
Kent Wickstrom Jensen
Majbrit Rostgaard Evald
Suna Løwe Nielsen
Mick Hancock
Mette Søgaard Nielsen

Foundation for Entrepreneurship Catinet

Ecuador Escuela Superior 
Politécnica del 
Litoral (ESPOL)- 
ESPAE Graduate 
School of 
Management

Virginia Lasio
Ma. Elizabeth Arteaga
Guido Caicedo

Escuela Superior Politécnica del Litoral 
(ESPOL)
Survey Data

Survey Data
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Egypt The British 
University in 
Egypt (BUE)
Egyptian 
Junior Business 
Association (EJB)
Middle East 
Council for Small 
Businesses and 
Entrepreneurship, 
(MCSBE)

Hala Hattab
David Kirby
Amr Gohar
Mohamed Ismail
Sherin El-Shorbagi
Lois Stevenson
Khaled Farouq

Industrial Modernization Center, Ministry 
of Trade & Industry

AC Nielsen

Finland Turku School 
of Economics, 
University of 
Turku

Anne Kovalainen
Pekka Stenholm
Tommi Pukkinen
Jarna Heinonen 

Ministry of Employment and the 
Economy
Turku School of Economics, University 
of Turku

Taloustutkimus 
Oy

France EMLYON 
Business School

Olivier Torres
Danielle Rousson

Caisse des Depots CSA

Germany Leibniz University 
of Hannover 
and
Federal 
Employment 
Agency (BA) 
– Institute for 
Employment 
Research (IAB)

Rolf Sternberg
Udo Brixy
Christian Hundt
Arne Vorderwülbecke

Federal Employment Agency (BA) – 
Institute for Employment Research (IAB)

Zentrum fuer 
Evaluation 
und Methoden 
(ZEM), Bonn

Ghana Institute of 
Statistical, Social 
and Economic 
Research, 
University of 
Ghana

Ernest Aryeetey
George Owusu
Paul W. K. Yankson
Robert Osei
Kate Gough
Thilde Langevang

Danish Research Council

Greece Foundation for 
Economic and
Industrial Research 
(IOBE)

Stavros Ioannides
Aggelos Tsakanikas
Stelina Chatzichristou

Foundation for Economic and
Industrial Research (IOBE)

Datapower SA

Guatemala Francisco 
Marroquín 
University

Hugo Maúl
Mónica de Zelaya
David Casasola
Georgina Tunarosa
Lisardo Bolaños
Irene Flores
Fritz Thomas
Jaime Diaz

Francisco Marroquín University Pablo Pastor

Hungary University of Pécs, 
Faculty of
Business and 
Economics
George Mason 
University
Indiana University

László Szerb
Zoltán J. Ács
Attila Varga
József Ulbert
Gábor Márkus
Attila Pethe
Dietrich Péter
Siri Terjesen 

OTKA Research Foundation theme 
number K 81527
George Mason University
University of Pécs, Faculty of Business 
and Economicsò
Budapest Corvinus University, Doctorol 
School of Business
Széchenyi University, Doctoral School of 
Regional- and Economic Sciences

Szocio-Gráf 
Piac-és 
Közvélemény-
kutató 
Intézet

Iceland Reykjavik 
University

Rögnvaldur J. 
Sæmundsson
Hannes Ottóson

Reykjavik University Capacent 
Gallup
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Iran University of 
Tehran

Abbas Bazargan
Caro Lucas
Nezameddin Faghieh
A .A. Moosavi-Movahedi
Leyla Sarfaraz
A. Kordrnaeij
Jahangir Yadollahi Farsi
M.Ahamadpour Daryani
S. Mostafa Razavi
Mohammad Reza Zali
Mohammad Reza Sepehri

Iran’ s Ministry of Labour and Social 
Affairs
Iran’s Labour and 
Social Security Institute (LSSI)

Dr. Mohammad 
Reza Zali

Ireland Dublin City 
University

Paula Fitzsimons
Colm O’Gorman

Enterprise Ireland IFF

Israel The Ira Center for 
Business,
Technology & 
Society, Ben 
Gurion University 
of the Negev

Ehud Menipaz
Yoash Avrahami
Miri Lerner
Yossi Hadad
Miri Yemini
Dov Barak
Harel Yedidsion

The Ira Center for Business,
Technology & Society, 
Ben Gurion University of the Negev
Sami Shamoon College of Engineering
Advanced Technology Encouragement 
Centre (ATEC) in the Negev

The Brandman
Institute

Italy EntER - Bocconi 
University

James Hayton
Giovanni Valentini

Target Research

Jamaica University of 
Technology, 
Jamaica

Girjanauth Boodraj
Vanetta Skeete
Mauvalyn Bowen
Joan Lawla
Marcia McPherson-
Edwards
Horace Williams

College of Business and Management, 
University of Technology, Jamaica

KOCI Market 
Research and 
Data Mining 
Services

Japan Keio University Takehiko Isobe Venture Enterprise Center
Ministry of Economy, Trade and Industry

Social Survey
Research 
Information
Co.,Ltd (SSRI)

Korea Jinju National 
University

Sung-sik Bahn
Sanggu Seo
Kyung-Mo Song
Dong- hwan Cho
Jong-hae Park
Min-Seok Cha

Small and Medium Business 
Administration (SMBA) 
Korea Aerospace Industries, Ltd. (KAI) 
Kumwoo Industrial Machinery, Co. 
Hanaro Tech Co., Ltd. 
Taewan Co., Ltd.

Hankook 
Research Co.

Latvia The TeliaSonera 
Institute at the
Stockholm School 
of Economics
in Riga

Olga Rastrigina
Anders Paalzow
Alf Vanags
Vyacheslav Dombrovsky

TeliaSonera AB SKDS

Macedonia University 
“Ss. Cyril and 
Methodius” – 
Business Start-Up 
Centre
Macedonian 
Enterprise 
Development 
Foundation 
(MEDF)

Radmil Polenakovik
Tetjana Lazarevska
Lazar Nedanoski
Gligor Mihailovski
Marija Sazdevski
Bojan Jovanovski
Trajce Velkovski
Aleksandar Kurciev
Bojan Jovanoski
Igor Nikoloski
Ljupka Mitrinovska

Macedonian Enterprise Development 
Foundation (MEDF)
National Centre for Development of 
Innovation and Entrepreneurial Learning 
(NCDIEL)

Brima Gallup
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Malaysia University Tun 
Abdul Razak

Roland Xavier
Leilanie Mohd Nor
Dewi Amat Sepuan
Mohar Yusof

University Tun Abdul Razak Rehanstat

Mexico Tecnológico de 
Monterrey

Marcia Campos
Arturo Torres
Elvira Naranjo

Tecnologico de Monterrey Alduncin y 
Asociados

Montenegro University of 
Montenegro

Dragan Lajovic
Milorad Jovovic
Tamara Backovic 
Stana Kalezic
Olja Stankovic
Radmila Damjanovic
Milos Raznatovic
Irena Peric
Nada Radovanic
Ivana Zecevic
Ana Sebek
Stevan Karadaglic
Miljan Sestovic

Economic Faculty of Montenegro
Investment Development Fund of 
Montenegro
Ministry of Economy Of Montenegro
Employment Agency of Montenegro
Directorate for Development of Small 
and Medium-Sized Enterprises
Chamber of Economy Montenegro

Damar DOO 
Podgorica

Netherlands EIM Business and 
Policy Research

Jolanda Hessels
Chantal Hartog
Sander Wennekers
André van Stel
Roy Thurik
Philipp Koellinger
Peter van der Zwan
Ingrid Verheul
Niels Bosma

Ministry of Economic Affairs, 
Agriculture and Innovation

Stratus

Norway Bodø Graduate 
School of Business

Lars Kolvereid
Erlend Bullvåg
Bjørn-Willy Åmo
Terje Mathisen
Eirik Pedersen

Ministry of Trade and Industry
Innovation Norway
Kunnskapsparken Bodø AS, Center for 
Innovation and Entrepreneurship
Kunnskapsfondet Nordland AS
Bodø Graduate School of Business

TNS Gallup

Pakistan Institute of 
Business 
Administration 
(IBA), Karachi 

Sarfraz A. Mian 
Arif I. Rana
Zafar A. Siddiqui
Shahid Raza Mir
Shahid Qureshi

US Agency for International 
Development.
Centre for Entrepreneurial Development, 
IBA, Karachi. 
LUMS, Lahore
Babson College, USA

Oasis 
International 

Palestine The Palestine 
Economic Policy 
Research Institute 
-MAS

Samir Abdullah 
Yousef Daoud
Tareq Sadeq
Muhannad Hamed
Alaa Tartir

Arab Fund for Economic & Social 
Development
Palestinian National Authority (PNA)

The Palestine 
Central Bureau 
of Statistics 
(PCBS)

Peru Universidad ESAN Jaime Serida 
Oswaldo Morales
Keiko Nakamatsu
Liliana Uehara

Universidad ESAN Imasen
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Portugal
Regional 
Team:
Azores

SPI Ventures
Universidade dos 
Açores (UAC)

SPI Ventures

Augusto Medina
Douglas Thompson
Sara Medina
João Rodrigues
Nuno Gonçalves
Gualter Manuel Medeiros 
do Couto
João Crispim Borges da 
Ponte
Nélia Cavaco Branco

IAPMEI (Instituto de Apoio às Pequenas 
e Médias Empresas e à Inovação)

FLAD (Fundação Luso-Americana para o 
Desenvolvimento)

Governo Regional dos Açores (Secretaria 
Regional da Economia)
PROCONVERGENCIA

GfKMetris 
(Metris – 
Métodos de 
Recolha e 
Investigação 
Social, S.A.)

Romania Babes-Bolyai 
University, Faculty 
of Economics and 
Business
Administration 

Matiş Dumitru
Nagy Ágnes
Györfy Lehel-Zoltán
Pete Ştefan
Benyovszki Annamária
Petru Tünde Petra
Szerb László
Mircea Comşa
Ilieş Liviu
Szász Levente
Matiş Eugenia

Babeş-Bolyai University, Faculty of 
Economics and Business Administration

Metro Media
Transilvania

Russia Saint Petersburg 
Team
Graduate School 
of Management, 
Saint Petersburg

Olga Verkhovskaya
Maria Dorokhina
Galina Shirokova

Graduate School of Management
at Saint Petersburg State
University

Levada-Center

Moscow Team 
State University 
- Higher School 
of Economics, 
Moscow

Alexander Chepurenko
Olga Obraztsova
Tatiana Alimova 
Maria Gabelko 
Kate Murzacheva

State University - Higher School
of Economics
Ministry of Economic Development of 
Russian Federation

Saudi Arabia The National 
Entrepreneurship 
Center
Alfaisal University

Munira A. Alghamdi
Hazbo Skoko
Norman Wright
Ricardo Santa
Wafa Al Debasi

The Centennial Fund/National 
Entrepreneurship Center

IPSOS

Slovenia Institute for 
Entrepreneurship 
and
Small Business 
Management,
Faculty of 
Economics & 
Business,
University of 
Maribor

Miroslav Rebernik
Polona Tominc
Ksenja Pušnik
Katja Crnogaj

Ministry of the Economy
Slovenian Research Agency
Finance – Slovenian Business
Daily

RM PLUS

South Africa The UCT Centre 
for Innovation and 
Entrepreneurship,
Graduate School 
of Business,
University of Cape 
Town

Mike Herrington
Jacqui Kew
Penny Kew

Swiss South African Cooperation 
Initiative (SSACI)
Services SETA 
Small Enterprise Development Agency 
(SEDA)

Nielsen South 
Africa
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Spain
Regional 
Teams:
Andalucía
Asturias
Aragón
Basque 
Country
Canary I.
Cantabria
Catalonia
Ceuta
C. Valenciana
Extremadura
Galicia
Madrid City
Murcia
Navarra

Instituto de 
Empresa
Regional 
Universities:
Universidad de 
Cádiz
Univ. De Oviedo
Univ. de Zaragoza
Orkestra
Univ. De Deusto
Univ. Basque 
Country
Univ. Mondragón.
Universidad de 
Las Palmas de 
Gran Canaria 
& Universidad de 
La Laguna
Univ. De Cantabria
Cátedra Pyme de 
la Universidad de 
Cantabria.
Universidad 
Autónoma de 
Barcelona
Universidad de 
Granada
Univ. Miguel 
Hernández
Fundación Xavier 
de Salas
Univ. De 
Extremadura
Confederación de 
Empresarios de 
Galicia (CEG)
CEEI Galicia, SA 
(BIC Galicia)
Universidad 
de Santiago de 
Compostela
IEBS
Univ. de Murcia
Centro Europeo 
de Empresas e 
Innovación de 
Navarra
Servicio Navarro 
de Empleo.

Juan José Güemes
Ignacio de la Vega
Alicia Coduras
Rafael Pampillón
Cristina Cruz
Rachida Justo
Ricardo Hernández
April Win
Regional Team Directors:
José Ruiz Navarro
Enrique Loredo
Lucio Fuentelsaz
Iñaki Peña
Rosa M. Batista Canino
Fco. Javier Martínez
Carlos Guallarte
Yancy Vaillant
Lázaro Rodríguez
Mª del Mar Fuentes
José Mª Gómez Gras
Ricardo Hernández 
Juan Carlos Díaz
Araceli de Lucas
Iñaki Ortega
Antonio Aragón
Alicia Rubio
Cristina García

DGPYMES
IE Business School
Junta de Andalucía
Gob. del Principado de Asturias
Gob. de Aragón
Dpto, Industria, Comercio y
Turismo
Instituto Aragones Fomento
Consejo Aragones Cámaras de
Comercio.
Eusko Ikaskuntza
SPRI, Gobierno Vasco
Diputación Foral Álava
Diputación Foral Bizkaia
Diputación Foral Gipuzkoa
Fundación Emilio Soldevilla
La Caja de Canarias
Gobierno de Canarias, Promoción
Económica y Servicio Canario de 
Empleo.
Fondo Social Europeo
Santander
Gob. Regional Cantabria. Consejería de 
Economía y Hacienda.
Grupo Sordecan
Fundación UCEIF
Diputació de Barcelona: Àrea de 
Desenvolupament Econòmic. Generalitat 
de Catalunya: Departament de Treball.
PROCESA
Air Nostrum
IMPIVA
Junta Extremadura, Univ. De 
Extremadura, Central Nuclear Almaraz, 
Sofiex, Arram Consultores, CCOO 
U.R Extremadura, Urvicasa Caja Rural 
de Extremadura, Palicrisa Fundación 
Academica Europea de Yuste. Fomento 
de Emprendedores, Grupo Alfonso 
Gallardo, Infostock Europa Extremadura, 
Cámara Comercio Cáceres. UGT 
Extremadura, El Periódico Extremadura, 
Hoy Diario de Extremadura, Fomento 
Emprendedores, Infocenter, Ogesa, Hotel 
Huerta Honda
Confederación Empresarios Galicia 
(CEG)
CEEI Galicia SA (BIC Galicia)
Universidad de Santiago de Compostela 
Caja Madrid
Ayuntamiento de Madrid
Fundación Caja Murcia
Consejería de Economía, Empresa e 
Innovación
Instituto Fomento región de Murcia.
Centro Europeo de Empresas e 
innovación de Murcia
Univ. Murcia
Gobierno de Navarra, Servicio Navarro 
de Empleo.

Instituto 
Opinòmetre
S.L.
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Sweden Swedish 
Entrepreneurship 
Forum

Pontus Braunerhjelm
Ulrika Stuart Hamilton
Mikael Samuelsson
Kristina Nyström
Per Thulin

Vinnova
CECIS 
Confederation of Swedish Enterprise

DEMOSKOP

Switzerland School of Business 
Administration 
(HEG-FR) 
Fribourg

Rico J. Baldegger
Andreas A. Brülhart
Mathias J. Rossi
Patrick E. Schüffel
Thomas Straub
Sabine Frischknecht
Muriel Berger
Verena Huber

KTI /CTI (Conferderation’s Innovation 
Promotion Agency)
School of Business Administration 
(HEG-FR) Fribourg

gfs Bern 

Taiwan National Chengchi 
University
China Youth 
Career 
Development 
Association 
Headquarters 
(CYCDA)

Chao-Tung Wen
Chang-Yung Liu
Su-Lee Tsai
Yu-Ting Cheng
Yi-Wen Chen
Ru-Mei Hsieh
Chung-Min Lo
Li-hua Chen
Shih-Feng Chou

Small and Medium Enterprise 
Administration, Ministry of Economic 
Affairs 
 

NCCU Survey 
Center

Trinidad and 
Tobago

Arthur Lok Jack 
Graduate School 
of Business, 
University of the 
West Indies

Karen Murdock 
Miguel Carillo
Colin McDonald

Arthur Lok Jack Graduate School of 
Business, University of the West Indies

Tunisia Institut des 
Hautes Etudes 
Commerciales - 
Sousse

Faysal Mansouri
Lotfi Belkacem

GTZ – Programme d’Appui à 
l’Entrepreneuriat et à l’Innovation

Optima

Turkey Yeditepe 
University

Esra Karadeniz Union of Chambers and Commodity 
Exchanges of Turkey (TOBB)
 United States Agency International 
Development
(USAID) 

Akademetre

Uganda Makerere 
University 
Business School 
(MUBS)

Rebecca Namatovu
Warren Byabashaija
Arthur Sserwanga
Sarah Kyejjusa
Wasswa Balunywa
Peter Rosa

Danish Research Council
Makerere University Business School

Makerere 
University 
Business 
School

United 
Kingdom
 
 
 

Aston University Mark Hart
Jonathan Levie
Michael Anyadike-Danes
Yasser Ahmad Bhatti
Aloña Martiarena 
Arrizabalaga 
Mohammed Karim
Liz Blackford
Erkko Autio
Alpheus Tlhomole

Department for Business, Innovation and 
Skills (BIS)
ONE North East
Welsh Assembly Government
Enterprise UK
PRIME
Birmingham City Council
Aston Business School
Hunter Centre for Entrepreneurship, 
University of Strathclyde 

IFF Research 
Ltd.
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United States Babson College Julio DeCastro
I..Elaine Allen
Abdul Ali
Candida Brush
William D. Bygrave
Marcia Cole
Lisa Di Carlo
Julian Lange
Moriah Meyskens
John Whitman
Edward Rogoff
Monica Dean 
Thomas S. Lyons
Joseph Onochie
Ivory Phinisee
Al Suhu

Babson College
Baruch College

OpinionSearch 
Inc.

Uruguay University of 
Montevideo 

Leonardo Veiga
Adrián Edelman
Pablo Regent
Fernando Borraz
Alvaro Cristiani
Cecilia Gomeza

University of Montevideo
Banco Santander Uruguay

Equipos Mori

Vanuatu UNITEC Robert Davis
Malama Solomona
Asoka Gunaratne
Judith King
Andrina Thomas-Lini

AusAID
UNITEC New Zealand

UNITEC New 
Zealand

Zambia University of 
Zambia

Francis Chigunta
Valentine Mwanza
Moonga Mumba
Mulenga Nkula

Danish Research Council Department of 
Development 
Studies, 
University of 
Zambia

GEM Global 
Coordination 
Team

Kristie Seawright
Mick Hancock
Yana Litovsky
Chris Aylett
Jackline Odoch
Marcia Cole
Jeff Seaman
Niels Bosma
Alicia Coduras




